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Summary

1. Guo Xuekun can do it. He takes on no patients at the clinic, but does the operations 
only.

2. Usually he does those operations. He does all kidney transplants here.

3. If the surgery is needed, the technology is very mature, anyway, we have done a lot!

4. Some hospitals have more kidney resources, so they can do more now. The more 
kidney resources a hospital has, the more cases it does, and vice versa--this is very 
normal!

Translation

Investigator: Hello, how are you? Is this the Third Affiliated Hospital of Sun Yat-sen 
University?

Nurse: Um.

Investigator: I would like to ask you some questions. I’m from Shenyang, but my relative 
is doing business in Guangzhou. He’s suffering from renal failure, and is hospitalized at 
the hospital there. The doctor said he must get a kidney transplant, so I am calling your 
hospital to ask if your hospital can do it quickly.  If he comes to get on your waiting list, 
in the fastest case, can it be done in one month, or in two weeks? I’d appreciate your 
answering my questions.

Nurse: That’s hard to say. It depends on if his tissue typing works out for him.

Investigator: Can you refer a doctor to me?



Nurse: Um, our doctors are all pretty good.

Investigator: Ah, I’d like to have the best surgeon, the one at the level of authoritative 
experts such as professors or chief physicians.

Nurse: All our doctors, they are all roughly at the same technical level.

Investigator: Really? Then don’t they have…

Nurse: Right, you should come over to take a look; you can come to our clinic here.

Investigator: Ah.

Nurse: Come to the clinic and look for a doctor, okay?

Investigator: Right, I have searched a few of your doctors on the internet now, such as 
Gao Xuekun, and Hong Liangqing.

Nurse: Guo Xuekun can do it. He takes on no patients at the clinic, but does the 
operations.

Investigator: Ah, he only does the operations.

Nurse: You can contact him as well, and you can call his clinic too. He usually performs 
the operations, and he does all kidney transplants.

Investigator: Ah, he is absolutely a chief surgeon, right?

Nurse: Yes!

Investigator: Ah, if he has done that many, I'm sure he has no technical problems.

Nurse: Anyways, the kidney transplant operations are very mature. Anyway, we have 
done a lot, ah.

Investigator: Since what year has Dr. Guo started doing it?

Nurse: Hey, he's very good. He's 40 to 50, or over 50 years old, and he has done a lot, for 
decades.

Investigator: I asked a number of hospitals how many they do annually. Some do more 
than one hundred cases a year; some do two or three hundred. Some even do more than 
five hundred a year--I’d say that’s about the techniques, ah, their techniques are very 
solid.



Nurse: Right, some hospitals have more kidney resources, so they can do more now. The 
more kidney resources a hospital has, the more cases it does, and vice versa--this is very 
normal!

Investigator: Ah, ah, well, here’s the most important, the last question. For the kidney 
organs donated by those who are critically sick, for example, smokers, drinkers, how can
you tell if those donated kidneys are healthy or unhealthy? Are there any…?

Nurse: That I don’t know. You have to ask the doctor!

Investigator: Oh?

Nurse: Hey, how can I tell if they are good or not? I am not a doctor, but a nurse! If you 
really have any questions, if you want to know their answers, you need to come make an 
appointment at the clinic, and consult the doctor, okay?

Investigator: Oh, oh, oh, that’s okay, Thank you!

Nurse: You’re welcome!

Investigator: Hey, thanks!

Nurse: Bye!

Investigator: Hey, bye!


