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Summary

1. Here we have quite a few doctors: Lin Tao, Wang Li, Fan Yu, and Huang Zhongli—
they have their transplant teams.

2. Investigator: Usually you do it every month, right?
Nurse: Right.

3. The beds’ supply is tight now.

4. To get the transplant surgery done using a kidney from an outside source, it would be 
200,000 yuan if all goes well.

Translation

Investigator:  Hello? 

Nurse: Hello, hi!

Investigator: Ah, hi! I am looking for Kidney Transplant at West China Hospital of 
Sichuan University. Is this the right number?  

Nurse: Ah, yes.

Investigator: I’d like to ask…my husband wants to have a kidney transplant. So, I’m 
thinking, shall we bring the patient over directly, or bring his files over for you to take a 
look first? 

Nurse: Have you visited the clinic before?

Investigator: We haven’t been to your hospital. You were just referred to us by my 
classmate. Because my (husband), he is staying in the Xinqiao Hospital now, and wants 



to get transferred to yours. He says you do a good job there, and wants to come to your
hospital to take a look.

Nurse: Then you need to get registered first.

Investigator: Then may I ask which doctor would be a better choice to make an 
appointment with, at your hospital?

Nurse: Here we have quite a few doctors: Lin Tao, Wang Li, Fan Yu, and Huang 
Zhongli—they are all fine.

Investigator: Oh.

Nurse: For those four physicians, as I told you just now, you can decide which one to 
pick. They have a transplantation group. Any physician in the transplantation group is 
okay.

Investigator: Well, by the way, let me ask another question. If we can get on the waiting 
list, if we meet all the requirements, approximately how long will be the wait time for the 
surgery?

Nurse:  That depends. That I don’t know.  Because we are at the inpatient service unit 
here, not the outpatient clinic, the tissue typing is all done at the outpatient clinic.  The 
patient won’t come to the inpatient service unit until when he needs to receive the 
surgery.

Investigator: Oh, you are at the inpatient service, right?

Nurse: That’s right. This is the inpatient service here.

Investigator: Oh, as you’re in the inpatient service, you got to know a lot. Then I’d like to 
ask, in general at your place, according to your experience, usually once they come here, 
in the fastest case, what’re the chances of getting an operation done within half a month 
or a week?

Nurse: No, that cannot be done. We’d need a few months!

Investigator: Need a few months?

Nurse: Yes. You will need to be reviewed and approved. For those test results or 
documents, you also need to get the tissue typing done. It all depends.

Investigator: Well, my classmate says that his father had it done at your hospital and it 
was quite quick. He says that you guys do a lot of cases and are good at it. So, in general 
you guys do it every month, right? 



Nurse: Yes,

Investigator: Then if we come over, do you have many beds? Will we be able to get 
admitted into your hospital?

Nurse: The beds’ supply is pretty tight now. It’s pretty tight.

Investigator: Oh. So, in general, after you’re done with the surgery, in general about how 
many days would the patient have to stay in your hospital before he can get discharged?

Nurse: About a little over 20 days. If things go smoothly, it would be a little over 20 
days.

Investigator: Then another thing I want to ask about...about the cost, do you know?  What 
is the approximate price for a kidney transplant?

Nurse: Would the kidney be donated from a relative, or from an outside kidney source 
that you need to wait for?

Investigator: Need to wait for outside support. Wait for outside support for the kidney 
organ.

Nurse: If you wait for an outside kidney source, it would be about 200,000 yuan.

Investigator: 200,000 yuan? That includes all the operation cost?

Nurse: Yes, it’s about 200,000 yuan.

Investigator: Oh. Okay. Well, thank you!

Nurse: No problem. Okay. Goodbye!

Investigator: Em, Okay. Goodbye! 


